
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM 
 
SUBJECT: Recommend the Award of Bid 17-044, Brush Collection Program 
  
TYPE OF VOTE: Simple Majority 
  
ACTION REQUESTED:  
Approve the Award of Bid 17-044, Brush Collection Program, to Steve Piper and Sons for an 
amount not to exceed $81,080 and to Trees “R” Us, Inc. for an amount not to exceed $94,250, 
for a total award of $175,330.  
 
BOARD/COMMISSION REVIEW:   
N/A 
 
COUNCIL ACTION PREVIOUSLY TAKEN: 

Date  Item No. Action 
N/A   
  
DEPARTMENT: Department of Public Works (DPW) 

Finance Department 
  
SUBMITTED BY: Richard Dublinski, DPW Director 

Rachel Mayer, Finance Director 
  
BACKGROUND: 
Each May the Department of Public Works (DPW) collects branches placed along the curbsides 
in bulk as part of the City’s annual Brush Collection Program. In years past, DPW’s employees 
administered the program and performed brush pick-up with assistance from one contractor for 
the entire City. As part of the CY2017 budget process, City Council approved contracting the 
curbside brush program in its entirety. This allows DPW’s employees to refocus on other 
necessary service areas, such as tree trimming and sign maintenance, which are of great 
importance to residents. 
 
Brush collection is performed by work crews of two to three workers using a chipping device 
towed behind a truck with an enclosed chip box or grapple equipment capable of loading brush.  
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The work performed under this contract includes all necessary equipment and all personnel 
required to perform brush collection.  
 
Requirements of the program will remain consistent with past years. The one noticeable change 
for residents will be extending the program from four to five weeks. Under the new schedule, 
each garbage collection day will be assigned a separate week for brush collection. DPW is 
working closely with Communications to communicate the schedule change to residents and an 
interactive map will be updated daily during the program. The schedule for 2017 is as follows: 
 

Homes with garbage 
collection on this day 

Must place brush on 
the parkway by 

For collection one time during 
the week of 

Monday May 14 May 15-19 
Tuesday May 21 May 22-26 
Wednesday May 29 May 30 - June 2 
Thursday June 4 June 5-9 
Friday June 11 June 12-16 

 
Because staff was concerned that the garbage collection areas may be too large for a supplier to 
complete in a one week period, the areas were further subdivided in sub-groups A and B.  Maps 
showing the brush collection areas and the sub-groups are attached.  
 
DISCUSSION: 
Advertisement Date: 01/27/2017 Notices Sent:   47 
Opening Date: 02/14/2017 Planholders:     9 
  Bids Received:     4      
 
BID TABULATION 
 
Bids were received from the following suppliers (Bidders were not required to bid all 
groups/weeks): 
Group A Bid Results 

Week  
Steve Piper 
 & Sons Trees "R" Us 

Kramer Tree 
Specialists 

Homer Tree 
Service  

1  $           16,146.00   $           22,700.00   $           28,420.40   $           50,000.00  
2  $           14,896.00   $           22,500.00   $           27,783.00   $           47,500.00  
3  $           10,384.00   $           22,600.00   $           25,999.20   $           50,000.00  
4  $           10,278.00   $           22,800.00   No Bid   $           37,500.00  
5  $           13,773.00   $           23,300.00   No Bid   $           50,000.00  
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Group B Bid Results 

Week  
Steve Piper  
& Sons Trees "R" Us 

Kramer Tree 
Specialists 

Homer Tree 
Service 

1  $           13,870.00   $           23,600.00   No Bid   $           45,500.00  
2  $           17,177.00   $           24,150.00   No Bid   $           50,000.00  
3  $           13,984.00   $           24,800.00   No Bid   $           40,000.00  
4  $           19,879.00   $           22,600.00   $           33,099.50   $           50,000.00  
5  $           17,879.00   $           22,900.00   $           34,064.80   $           45,000.00  

 
Despite Steve Piper & Sons being the low bidder for all sections, staff recommends the contract 
be given to two vendors due to the fact that this is the first time we are outsourcing the 
contracted work. This will allow each vendor to have appropriate resources for greater coverage 
to ensure work is completed on schedule. Based on discussions with the two low bidders, staff 
recommends Steve Piper & Sons be given six of the ten sections. As the second low bidder, 
Trees “R” Us is recommended for four of the ten sections. Both vendors also provided pricing 
for optional extra work needed during the brush collection program.  If additional work is 
needed, a change order will be recommended for approval.   
 
The total cost to outsource the brush collection services to the two vendors is $175,330.  Last 
year, the City spent approximately $177,000 to administer the program in-house.  The cost to 
outsource is generally in line with the City’s cost to perform the services in-house. By 
outsourcing this work, it frees up DPW staff to perform other functions.   
 
The term of this contract is May 1, 2017 through April 30, 2018, with two one-year options 
available. 
 
FISCAL IMPACT:  
CIP #: N/A 
 
Contracted brush collection service is expensed to the Support Services line below. A total of 
$175,000 is budgeted for this service in CY2017. 
 

Account Number Fund Description Total Budget Amount 
010-4230-431.30-29 General Fund $1,658,540 

 
RECOMMENDATION: 
Approve the Award of Bid 17-044, Brush Collection Program, to Steve Piper & Sons for an 
amount not to exceed $81,080 and Trees “R” Us, Inc. for an amount not to exceed $94,250, for a 
total award of $175,330. 
 
ATTACHMENTS: 
1. Brush Collection Maps 
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Week 1 (Monday) Brush Collection

Legend
Districts
Maintained by Others
WEEK 1A = 45.4 MI
WEEK 1B = 39.0 MI
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EE

K
CR

ES
S

MI
LL

CT.
HOPI

W
EB

ST
ER

JO
SE

PH

49TH 

48TH

ST
.

WA
SH

IN
GT

ON

14TH

AV.13TH

12TH

11TH

ST
.

ST
.

AV.10THEA
GL

E 
    

    
  S

T.

8TH

MA
IN

W
EB

ST
ER

MO
RN

IN
GS

ID
E

CR.

PE
AR

SO
N

AV.6TH

AV.
5TH

MI
LL

5TH                           AV.

VAN

ST
.

MA
IN

WATER
ST

.
W

EB
ST

ER

AV.

LIN

EA
GL

E

BENTO

MI
LL

EW
IN

G

SPRING

BUREN
VAN

COT-

STEVENS

ST
.

W
ES

T
ST

.
FR

EM
ON

TST
.

LA
IR

D

AV.
JEFFERSON

FO
RE

ST

WILSONDOUGLAS

AV.JACKSON

(P
VT

.) C
T.

CO
DY

AV.
7.

6.

3.
4.

5.

ST
.

PORTER

HILLSIDE

MARTIN        AV.

DR
.

AC
RE

S

6. K INSTON CT.
5. ATLANTA CT.
4. OKOLONA CT.
3. MANASSAS CT.
2. CHANCELLOR
1. RICHMOND

RIDGE

CT.

GOLDEN
GATE LN.

LAKERIDGE CT.
WATERVIEW CT.

ES
LA

CT
.

WESTINGS AV. COMFORTDR.

D.BA
Y SC TT

CR.

NE
DH

AM
 

BU
LG

ER

CT
.

CT
.

CONNECTORRD.

W
IN

FI
EL

D

CH
AS

E

VISTA

TO
RCH

PKWY.

LA
ND

ON
    

    
    

    
DR

.

RIVER

TOWNLINE

ROGERSWA
GN

ER

RD.

RD.FO
W

LE
R

CR
.

KL
INE

1. 1.
2.

GREENBLVD.
VILLAGE GREEN CT.

OSWEGO         
   RD.

75TH                      ST.

 1. FA IRMONT CT.(122)

LN.
GABRIELLE

BUNKER HILL CR.

    CT.
SANDPIPER

EAST

ST
.

GREGORY

LN.
RAINTREE

LN.SPRINGLANE
SANDPEBBLE LN.

SHADY BROOK LN.
SAND-

D.

C.
B.

A.

HALF MOON CR.

ROYAL
PORT

RD.

CANE
FR

ON
T

GR
EG

OR
Y

7. 6.

5.

4.
3. 2.

1.LN
.

IRAF
AY M

AV.
17.

11.

12.13.

LN.

OODWGATE

LN
.

CH
 U

RC
HI

LL16.
15.

CT.ST. CROIX

KITTS
ST.

ST. BARTHELEMY LN.

14.

RKPA

LN.

EC
HO

10.

9. LA
KE

S 
 B

LV
D.

EADOW

8.VIEWWILLOW

McCOY                   DR.

LN.
KIRK-

LN.
PEPPER

DR.EXECUTIVE

DR.
WESTBROOK

DR.

CENTERVALLEY

FOX

DR.
WODAEM

LONG

TRADE

HEALTHWAY  DR.

DR.

CAMPUS

DR.

CT.
ENTERPRISE

LIBERTY

SUSSEX AV.

CO
MM

ER
CE

ST
.

ST
.

EN
TE

RP
RI

SE

CT
.

EX
CH

AN
GE

EXCHANGE        AV.

I

ANID
RE M

CHESAP EAK DR.
BAYHEAD

CT.LANDINGDR.

PL
.

BE
NN

ET
T

KK.LL.

JJ.
II.

BB
.

AA
.

GG
.

FF
.EE
.

DD
.

CC
.

BRAXTON

HEATHER
DR.

GLEN

HH.

MM.

NN.

NARECE CT.

INTERSTATE RT. 88

DARKCT.
CT

.
DR

IF
TW

OO
D

WRIG
HT

DIA
NE

LO
OM

IS

LOOKOUT

A

KIMB

ORIOLE

DR.

ST.

BUN

TUPELO

CT
.

JU
LIA

N
CT.
HENNING

DR
.

SSE

WATE
RCR

CT.
DR.NASHUA

CT.
ABRAHAMSON

THRUSH

LN
.

AIVSYL

CT.
DOVELN

.
CA

RD
IN

AL

PIPER

SAND

CT.

WASHINGTON

75TH

DR
.

CT.LARCH

VILLASA
NT

A
LN

.

DR.

DR.DAMENOTRE

NG
E

SMEI

CT.
SW

EETBAY

DR.

WATER

LN.

CHERRY

LN.
HICKORY

LN
.

DR
.

SYCAMORE

RD.

GARTNER

ITONRT

LN.TANOAK
AV.

ARACK

AT
LA

S

LN
.

DR.

BA
SS

W
OO

D

CT.
ROWAN

OSAGE

DR
.

LN
.

CA
RO

L

LN.

FR
ED

ER
IC

K

S
PU

OL
YM

COLONY

YAB

STAR

ER
O

NO
CA

N

CR.

TIM

KING

DR.

MILLCT.
SCOTT

CT.
KINSIE

CT
.ST

AN
DIS

H
ASSICLAR

DEEPWOOD

O H
SO

N

CT.
LL 

LN.

LN.

KAUAI

CR
.

CR.

YOSEMITE

CT
.

DAKOTA

LN.
ENNEBEC

CR.

IROQUOIS

BILTMORE

HO
L

QU

GREENS-

ANNE

CENTRE POINT
RONALD REAGAN MEMORIAL TOLLWAY

PARKSIDE

RD.
DR

.

  LN.
CONCERT

CR
.

CARLSBAD

AV.
DR.YELLOWSTONE

RD.
BIGHORN

CR.
DENALI

CT.
LARKSPURAV.

BR
AE

MA
R

IS
NA

LA

BR
EN

CT.
WICK
LAMP-

CHIPPEWA CT.FO
XHORN

KA
IM

I
LO

CK
W

OO

WNEE           LN.

DR
.

CH
IP

PE
WA

SH
EN

AN
DO

AH

DR
.

KA
SA

CT
.

MA
PL

E
SI

LV
ER

LN.ENOMIN

TICONDEROGA

SH
ER

MA
N

CT.
JONESTER

ST
.

CO
LU

MB
IA

CT.
OAKRED 

CT
.

WA
VE

RL
Y

CT
.

MT
.

CT.
FA IRWINDS

MORVEN
CT.

BELLIN-

EDN
MA

TT

CT.BORO

CT.LEAFOAK

HU
FF

DR
.

OA
K

W
HI

TE

ST
.

JU
LIA

N

ST
.

WA
SH

IN
GT

ON

BLVD.

EZTROC

CT.KETTEN DR.
NETT

E
K

DR.

CACTUS
CT.

SMOKEY

4.

3.

AZTEC     
 CR.

DR.

AP
AC

H

MIAMI
CT.
INCA

2.
1.

CT.
PIMA

CT.
SIOUX

CT
.

ME
IS

CH

RD.
BAUER DR

.
KN

OL
L 

MA
PL

E

CT.
BRIAR
GREEN- TANGLE

AV.

BAYBERRY LN.MILLET

BA

CT.TREFOIL

SU
FF

OL
K

AV. CASE

ST
.

W
RI

GH
T

CT.
BLUEGRASS

ST
.

BR
AI

NA
RD

AV.

U.S.
OGDEN

LN.
WINDHAM

AV.

ST
.

CO
LU

MB
IA 

    
 

W
RI

GH
T

ST
.

LO
OM

IS

SL
EI

GH
T

AV.

AV.6TH

5TH

ST
.

BR
AI

N

EL
LS

W AV.7T

CE
N

FR

AV.

W
RI

ST
.

ST
.

SL
E

AV.4TH
NORTH

SC

ST
.

LO
OM

IS

ST
.

BR
AI

NA
RD

ST
.

EL
LS

AV. CE
NT

ER
    

  S
T.

AV.

VAPL
.

PA
RK

CE
NT

RA
L

CO
UR

T

ST
.

CO
LU

MB
IA

ST
.

W
RI

GH
T

HIGHLAND

AV.POR

LO
OM

IS

CT.VICTORIA

BR
AI

NA
RD

DR
.

D
WO

O
N

L

ST
.

RD
.

VIEW

ST
.

DR.

O
THLN.MAPLE

GOLDEN

CT. RE
WEL

LN
CT.

DR
.

CA
NO

PY

CO
LU

MB
IA

JU
LIA

N

W
EH

RL
I

RW
ILL

OW

ME
LO

DY

PINE SL
EI

GH
T

AB
RI

TE
R

WARRENVILLE

DIEHL

CR.GARDEN
SPRING

AV.

CR.

EA
ST

CH
AR

LE
S

DR.

WICKFIELD

DICKENS

YORKSHIRE

BRIGHTON

CH
AR

LE
S

NEEDHAMPLA
NK

LN.
4. 4. JAMATT CT.(71)

3. DILLMAN CT.(71)
2. CAMARIE  CT.(71)
1. BERNETTE CT.(71)

   (PVT.)

CT.TIMBER

CT.MILBURN

CT.PEACHTREE

CT
.

BU
TT

E

CHESHIRE

EMAJ
AV

.
CH

AR
LE

S

CR
.

RD. 

CR.

AV
.

VE
ST

VE
ST

CT
.

LY
ND

HU
RS

T

CT.

2.1.

CT
.

SIR

CR.

AV.

ROSEWOOD

AMBERWOOD

MURDSTONE

ONSIN

3.

CT.COLONIAL

CT.JUPITER

SYLVAN

ELIZABETH

FAIRENO
CHALLDON

CT.

CT.
CT.FLEETCOUNT

BARTON

CATHERINE 
CT.

RIVERVIEW
DR.

SH
AD

OW
CR

EE
K

CA

HT ERIN E

AV.

RID GECR.

COTSW OLD
DR.

DR
.

DR
.

BI
G 

RA
IL

DR
.CARBOXAV.

CREMIN
CT.

BROMBLEY

VISTAALTA

COMM

RI DGE
LN.

CT.

M

PRINC
ETON

CT.

PIPER

TREE WOOD

COMMONS

COMMONS

DR.
LAK ES DR.

DR.

WINDS

DR
.

FIS
HE

R

C

CT.

W

N S
LA

ING

LN.

TART AN
LN.

FA

TOWNLINE   RD.

PO
IN

T

BROOKDALE

CR.

R

CT.

CT.

CT.

CT
.

CT.

ST.

ANCHW

MA L

AV.

ON

DI A

O

17.

19.

ERW
KL

E

FIE
L D

CR
ES

T

F SAN CTUAR Y

LO

SCHUMACHER
DR.

FARMS

E.

O

SIDE  CT.

OW

OA
CT.

R

H

CT
.

M

OL

DEN ODR

G

CR.

CR
.

DR.

LN.

Y
DR

. RD
.

S

L

BIR

D

BL
AC

K

BO
CT.

CT.

C

CT
.

DR
.

D

CT.

D

MS

CT.

G

CT
.

DR
.

RD.

ST
.

ST
.ST

.

E

CT.

CT.

TF
OR

D
DR

.

PA

RD.

AV.

ELL
PKWY.

DR
.

CT.

CT.

AV.
(PVT.) (P

VT
.)

AV.

ST
.

TAGEAV.AV.

ST.

ST
.

BUREN AV.

ST
.

ST.

CT.

TRACE CR.

CT.

DR
.

LN.

LN.

W
ILL

IA
MS

BU
RG

DR
.

BURG

CT.

CT.

HI LOH

ST.

LA C

K

NSA LEWOOD

S

JUN IPER

RA
LD

DR
. NOLIA

LN.

O

BLOSSOM
I

R

EDGE

LN.

LN
.TA M

LN.
AV.

CLY
DE

ST.

TING
DR.

AV.

RD
.

DR.AR

RD.
VENSHIRE RD.

LN
.

B

TA
M

CAVAL
CA

DE
HO

N
ES

T
PL

EA
S U

RE

CT.

RD.
WH RL AWAY

I

RD
.N.

SU
NS

ET

ST
.

RD.

DR
.

ST
.

LAWN

AV.

DR
.

PRA IRIE

ST
.

HAW-

THORN

AV.

ST
.

AV.

KINGS

AI
L LO

W

A

MA
N

ST
.

AV.AN KLIN

GH
T

IG
HT

N BU RE N AV.
ST

.

AV
.

NDR
.

ST
.

H

ST
.

AR
D

W
OR

TH

HO OL

ST
.

ST
.

GRATH

CT.

VE
RN

ON

MO NT CEL LO
DR. MILTON

AV
.

CT.

ST
.

WISC
ST.

VEST
AV.

AV
.

AV
.

AV
.

ST.

SL
EI

GH
T

ST
.

RT. 34
AV.

RLEY

ST
.

AV.

ST.

WOOD LN.

M EE

LN.

CH
IC

W

LN
. K

D

DR.

ST
.

TON

DR.

CT.
CT.

RIDGE DR.

HI
LL

DR
.

END

MA
RI

A

D.

ING

CT.

SH
ER

ID
AN

CR.

CT.

CT.

CT.

BOND
ST.

BOND
CR.

AM
ER

IC
AN DR

.

PATRIOTSLN.

AM
ER

SA LE

DR.GR
EE

NW
OOD CR.

AL
EGRE

CR.

MIL ENNIUM
LN.L

DRIVE SOUTH

CT
.

RD.

L

RD.

HOLLOW

B

A
B

L

9.
7. 8.

6.6. OXLEY CR.
7. CHARLTON LN.
8. BRADFORD DR.9. NEUDEARBORN

NGDR.

E

AM

AV
.

ER

FRANK

RE
DR

.

MAN
CH

E
ST

ER

IN
VE

RR
AR

Y

CR
EE

K

PE
PP

ER
IDG

E
RD

.

GR
EE

N
DR

.

O
RT

ON
SB

ER
RY

LN
.

M

LE
PRO

VE

NCE

C

LA
UR

EL

AP
PR

OM
AT

TO
X

MERRIMAC

IL.
 R

OU
TE
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IL.
 R
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TE

 59

CA
LA

MO
S

CT
.

HI
LL

THREE
E

HILLSIDE RD.

TER

DR
.

CR
.

B

(PVT.)

(PVT.)

(P
VT

.)

(PVT.)

ST
.

FR
ON

TE
NA

C
RD

.

COMMONS

I

NI

TE
R

OR
TH

(PVT.)

A. ESTES CT. (126)
B. VAIL CT. (126)
C. GRAND LAKE CT. (126)
D. FLAT IRON DR. (126)
E. THREE FARMS RD. (126)

CLAREMONT  CT

LE
G A

CY
CR

DUNRAVEN AV.

RA
VE

ND
AL

E CT

FITNESS DR. 
(PVT.)

W
ES

TI
NG

S
CT

.

CITYGATE
LN

AUDUBON AV

BUTTERFLY LN

(PVT.)(PVT.)(PVT.)

CENT-
ENNIAL

CT

 3. SHELDON CT. (126)
 2. W ILDER CT. (126)
 1. STEINBECK CT. (126)

EN
TE

RP
RI

SE
 S

T

FR
ON

TE
NA

C 
CT

7. RIVER FRONT CR.(98)
6. V ILLAGE GREEN RD.(98)
5. RIVER BEND RD.(98)
4. DOCKSIDE CT.(98)

B. WINDSTREAM CT.

HENLEY LN

ST.

ST.

ST
AT

IO
N

BL
VD

.

ST
AT

IO
N 

 BL
VD

.

DREXEL AVE.

ST.NEW   YORK LN.

CHAMBERLAIN

WATKINS  LN.

 6. PEBBLE BEACH CT.(32)
 5. MULLIGAN DR.(17)
 4. SPYGLASS CT.(32)
 3. MASTERS CT.(17)
 2. KEMPER DR.(17)
 1. HILTON HEAD DR.(17)

 7. PRESTWICK DR.(17) 16. FIRESTONE CT.(33)
15. ST. ANDREWS CT.(33)
14. OAKMONT DR.(33)
13. INNISBROOK DR.(18)
12. P INEHURST DR.(18)
11. DORAL DR.(32)
10. MEDINAH DR.(32)
 9. CLUB HOUSE AV.(17)
 8. AUGUSTA DR.(17)

GR
OS

VE

NOR LN .

MI
LF

OR
D LN. LEWISBURG

LN.

MERID IAN PKWY.

WOOD AV.

CLARION
PROUD

GAR
TN

ER

RD.

BUTTER-

NUT DR.

STOOSLN.

AT
AL

PA
LN

.
HE

RC
UL

ES
L N

.

DR
.

S I
LV

ER
LO

C H
R D

SIL VE R

LOCH R D.

BA
Y O

U
P A

TH
DR

.SI
L V

ER-
SILVER-

LEAF CT.

A LDERLEAF LN.

BASIN

LN
.

TRAI L

CAPE-
SIDE DR.

LEY-
LAND 
DR.

ALDER-

LEAF CT.
TAIL-

LEAF CT.

BALSAM COV E R D.

53

19

34

6261

80

9594

66

Week 2 (Tuesday) Brush Collection
Legend

Districts
Maintained by Others
WEEK 2A = 44.1 MI
WEEK 2B = 48.3 MI



WILL COUNTY

DU
PA

GE

HAVENSHIRE CT.

MAPLEFIELD

75THAR
AP

AH
O

JESSICA 8. 7.
AV.

BO
OK

DR.COURTNEY

HILLS DR.
WHISPERING

CT
.

DE
NV

ER

CT
.

  ST.
POPLAR

DR.B.

CT.
SHEPPEY

DR.AMH

SHERIN

CR.

STONE

ED
DY

-

PL
AIN

FIE
LD

/N
AP

ER
VIL

LE

87TH

BURGESS HILL RD.

LN.MILLBROOK

BA
R

AV.TUPELO
RD.RENT

12.
CT.VERMONT

TA
LB

OT
 D

R. CT
.

CT.
SWAN-

DU
RN

ES
S

CT.
CARD-

CT.SEVERN

RR
IN

GT
ON

CARDIFF SH
EP

HE
RD

 D
R.

(79TH ST)
BAILEY

CR.
BOVI

RD.TAMA

CT
.

BA
LD

WI
N

    D
R.

BA
LD

WINCT.
SUMMERSET

DR
.

RE
NN

ET

V.GRIMES

R
E

DR
.

E
PIN

CT.TETON

DR.

NIST
ER

N
BA

DR.

NELGST
EW

CT.
APPLEGATE

DR.

APPLEGATE

RUSSET

DR.

CORTLAND 

CT.GREGORY
FESSLER AV.

ST.

LN
.

ME
AD

OW

80TH        ST.

MO
DA

FF

CT.
CABRIOLET

DR
.

NA
VA

RO
NE

AV.
TRAVELAI

DO
RV

AL

AV.
BAYVIEW

CR.

BUN

SWIFT

CHAT
BLUEBIRD

KINGLET

FINCH

LN.

CT.
SANDGATE

LA
NC

AS
TE

R

TUPELO

C.

NORTHFIELD DR.

R.D

CT.

SHOME

75TH

DR
.

CL
YD

E

LA
RK

CT.
TANAGER

CT
.

LO
NG

SP
UR

DR
.

LE
R

RB
WAVE

RD
IN

 LN
.

DR
.

G
STARLIN

LEDNDRE
CT.DIPPER

CL
YD

E

CT.FLICKER

CT.WOODFIELD OFTRCXOF

DR
.

CL
YD

ECR
.

AT
LA

S

BA
SS

WO
OD

LN
.

CA
RO

L

LN.

FR
ED

ER
IC

K

S
PU

OL
YM

COLONY

YAB

WAXWING

RD.
BAILEY

DR
.

REDNAEM

CT.FALLCREEK

CT.CREEK
STONE

CT.CREEK

WOOD

NDING 

CT.RILL

DR
.

CT
.

PL
AC

ER

CT.RAPIDS

CA
SC

AD
E

AV.

FL
CT

.
ES

TU
AR

Y

DR
.

QUAIL REDSTART

TE
RR

AN
CE

CT
.

WE
LT

ON

CE
AL

S

RD.
SAGEBRUSHRI

PA
RI

AN
 

DR
.

PRAIRIE

DELKIR
CT.CLOVERLEAF

PEACOCK

CT.
SAGINAW RD.CEDARBROOK

CT.
WEST-

CT.

TH
ORNHILL

CT.
INGTON

MR
AF

CT.KINGSWOOD

LONGRIDGE CT.

CR
.

SPRINGSIDE

CT.DEVLIN
CT.

GARTH

CT.BUCKLEY

BRIS

CT.
RIPLEY

CT
.

WA
LT

ON

CT.SABERCT
.

LA
RC

HM
ON

T

A.

87TH
CT.COVENTRY

CR
.

OOD

W
CHERRY

BRIARHEATH CR
.UNTRYSIDE

OC

RD.

SPLIT

CT.EASTLAND

RD.

CT.(PVT.)HARBOR

CT
.(P

VT
.)

CO
VE

BA
Y

RI
VE

R

CT.PIER

PHAETON

CT.WINSLOW

ST
.

SW
AL

LO
W

CT
.RE
DP

OL
L

KIL
LD

EE
R

LN.

DR
.

CT
.

ST
.

E.

LN.

CT.

DR
.

KIL
LD

EE
R

LN.

CT
.

RD.

B.
A.

ST.

DR
.

LN
.

HE
E

WOT
SC

HE
Y

RD.

TO
WN

WI
ST

ER
IA

WA
SH

IN
GT

ON

D.

SH
AD

OW
CR

EE
K

CT.

BR
OS

SM
AN

ST
.

FR
OS

T

LN.

BA
RN

ES

L
CONAN DOYLE

RD.

LA
ND

OR
E

DR
.

BE
NE

TT

SHA
AV.

EN
GL

IS
H

CT
. AS

HB
UR

Y
DR

. THACKERY

CROMWELL LN.

AU
S

AV
.

AU
ST

IN CT
.ARDS

AV.WO
LF

E
CT

.

GA
TE

SH
EA

D
DR

.

LN
.

SP
EN

SE
R

CT
.

BOSWELL

LN.

HOLLINGSWOOD AV.

HO
LL

IN
GS

WO
OD

CT
.

MA
LV

IN
A

PRELUDE

OB
BE

S 
DR

.

PO
ET

CT
.

SH
IR

E
CT

.

DR
.

KEATS  AV.

SAXON LN.

CARLYLE   RD. DR
.

PL
AIN

FIE
LD

/N
AP

ER
VIL

LE

96TH
CT.
ROBERT AV.

RI
VE

R DR
.

MA
ZO

O 

RIVER

ROCK
RIVER

CT.
OAK

CT.

SLT

RIV
CT.

FOX

IVE

LN.

WO
LF CT

.

F.

RING

IN
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LE
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.

ARDLEYCT.
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O RIV

ER
 M
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.

WEST

BRANCH
CT.

DR.

CROOKED

TREE
CT.

TRAPPERS
CT.

SETTLERSCT.

SCOTTSBRIDGERD.

HADDASSAH 
DR.

CRESTFIELDCT.
ALYSSACT.

DR.SIERRA

AV.

ST.

TIFFANYCT.

6.

WESTBROOK
CR

.
WENTWORTH

CT.

DANBUR
R.

WOODVIEW

WOO
D-

VIE
W

CT
.

WEATHERFORD

PIP
ER AV

. PONTIAC

CR.

PEBBLE-RD.

WOODL

CR.

MEADOW GREEN DR.

AMYCT.
WESLEYAV.

WA
YL

A D
DR.

2.
WATERBURYCT.

NO
R- CT
.

NANT CKET
RD.

1.
HARTFORDCT.

M ASSACH USETTS AV.

DR
.

BR
OC

KT
O

CR.BRIARHILL

DR
.

BR
IAR

HI
LL CT
.

EMPSTE AV.

ROCK PRING

WI
LM

IN
GT

ON CT
.

ROCK SPRINGCT.

MO
ON

LIG
HT CT

.
KE

YS
TO

NE CT
.

DR
.

AV.

SEVILLE AV.

ROXBURY
DR.

LISBUR

AV
.RI

DG
E

SP
RI

NG
BR

OO
K

MEADOW  DR.

RO
CK

CT
.

BO
UL

DE
R

CT
.

OTTINGHAM LN.
CONNECTICUT AV.

SHERWOOD

CT.

GL
EN

EA
GL

E
DR

.

LIT
CH

FIE
LD

CT
.

SW
AN

DY
KE

CT
.

GATESHEAD
DR.

WINT
ER

PA
RK

CT
. MAYFAIR BLODGETTCT. 3.

4.

5.

HAWLEYCT.

DR
.

MO
DA

RD
.

NE
WP

OR
T

DUPAHZE

SE
LE

R
DR

.

GL
EN

EA
GL

ES
CT

.

LN
.

ASALL AV.

SA
N

LU
IS

CT
.

NT
ER

 PA
DR

.

STEAMBOATRD.
BRECKENRIDGEPUEBLO

CT.

ME
SA

DR.

HE
YE

NE
R.

SILV
ER

SPUR
CT.

ALAMOSA

LINDHOLMCT.

DE LASALLECT.

COLORADO
CT.

REGENCY
CT.

HILLVIEW  DR.

PLAINVIEW  DR.

COUNTRYVIEW DR.

PA
RK

 LN
.

KEVIEW
DR.

ME
AD

OW
   L

N.

GALENA
CT.

ST. CROIX
MARENGOCT.
OCONTOCT.
PESHTIGO

AV.

NESKOLA
CT.

FL
AM

BE
AU

    
DR

.

MEYER
CT.

WA
UP

AC
A

CT
.

ME
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N 
   D

R.
RD

.
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BE
K 

RD
.

PER CT.

DOUGLAS RD.

AL
AG

O 
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D. GORDONCT.

WI
LE

DE
N
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.

LAUREL

DOUGLA

AL
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AL
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.
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LEVERENZ

RD.
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IS
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T
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.
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CT.

RY
AN CT
.
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H
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.
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CT.
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CT.
WINDEMERE
GREEN-
CT.
LEAWOODCT. C.

B.

A.
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CT.
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CT.
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STONE GA

TE
SH

EA
D
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.
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R.
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.

SPRINGLAKE DR.
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ITT
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.
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CT.

TE
E

GIR
L
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.

WE
LL
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LE

Y
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.

OCK

LN
.

LN.

RD
.

HAN-
CT.

WAYNESBURG
  ST.

3. HADDASSAH CT.(204)
4. COPPERFIELD CT.(204)
5. SIERRA CT.(204)
6. ASHTONLEE CT.(205)

DA
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.

TU
SS

EL
L

ST
.
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CH
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L
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EX
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Y-

FL
OW

ARRIAGE

E

LUMBUS DR.

SUTTON

CR.

RING 
EKCR.

T
ER

CREEK 

DR.

FOREST 

LN.

EA
GL

E

OOK DR.

DANIELLECT.

95TH

ST.

K

K
LS R

DR
.

WINNERS
CUP
CT.

BAKER

C
E

IN
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ON

CA

W

TIN

B

CT.

RID
GE

DR
.
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LN
.

S RD.

AL
ANDR.

AV.

CT.
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CT.

CT.

STONE
DAISY
LN.

ROL
LIN

G

LA

E.

ST.

LN. AV.
ST.

TING
DR.

AV.

DR.

LN
.

CT.

LN.

CT
.

CT.

KNOLL
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.

CT.

CT.

RD
.
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K
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.

DR.

DAE

RD.

E
T

A

IGAN DR
.

ROU

RD.
HAVENSHIRE RD.

RD.

SEA

TOG
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LBURY

TEM
PL
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TOLCT.

RD.
LN. D

OVER
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CR.

STONE
N

U

WI
CH

N

RE
DR

.
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.
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.

H AD

SA Y
S RD.

N

IW
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E
L
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C
N

D
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KNOLLS

RD.
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K WE

VE
R
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.
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NOCH

N OL D.PS

R
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.
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R
R
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R
A
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R.D
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.
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.
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.
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C
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Y
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.

R
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.
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.
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FIRETHORN

CT.

CR
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P

ST
.LE

DO
GW

OO
D

CT
.

DR
.

(PVT.)

A. ESTES CT. (126)
B. VAIL CT. (126)
C. GRAND LAKE CT. (126)
D. FLAT IRON DR. (126)
E. THREE FARMS RD. (126)

DUPAGE COUNTY

A. WISHING WELL (202)
B. STARLITE CT. (202)
C. LAKESIDE CT. (202)
D. HOMESTEAD CT. (202)

1. PROVIDENCE CT. (189)
2. NORTH HAMPTON CT. (189)

CT.BETHANY

SADDLE FARMLN.

SH
AR

ON
 C

T

SAW MILL

PINNACLECTFORD LN.

BAKER CT.

81ST ST.

LONG ACRE DR.
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LE
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.
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.
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.
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.

SU
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IN
G
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.
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.
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LE

Y
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.
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.TOWNSEND
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.
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NN
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ON VERBENACT.

CT.

AVENACT.

F IE
LD
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WE
DG
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OO

D
DR

.
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CK

HO
LL
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-

CT
.

SP
IN

NE
R
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.

KELLTOWNECT.

SEIL ER

CT.

ST
EM

BL
UE

-
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.
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CT.

KNOCH KNOLLS RD.

SH
ER

I
ST

.

DR.
FRA NKS TOW NE

DARFLERCT.
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KELLERLN.

TIM
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.
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N
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.
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CREEK
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E
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KAISER
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.
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.   
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Week 3 (Wednesday) Brush Collection

Legend
Districts
Maintained by Others
GROUP 3A = 29.2 MI
GROUP 3B - 41.4 MI



LISLE TWP.
DUPAGE TWP.

DU
PA

GE
RI

VE
R

CT.
OVE

CANTIGNY

BAYHILL

SARA

MUIRHEAD

LN.

AS
HCE

LT
ICDARKCT.

WEXFORD KBWOODBINE

LOOKOUT

A

KIMB

ORIOLE
DR.

ST.

BUN

SWIFT

CHAT
BLUEBIRD

KINGLET

FINCH

LN.

CT.
SANDGATE

LA
NC

AS
TE

R

TUPELO

C.

CT
.HENNING

DR
.

SSE

WAT
ER

CR

CT.
DR.NASHUA

CT.
ABRAHAMSON

LN.

PIPER

SAND

CT.

DR
.

CT
.

LO
NG

SP
UR

DR
.

LE
R

RB
WA

DR
.

G
STARLIN

LEDNDRE
CT.DIPPER

CT.FLICKER

OFTRCXOF

DR
.

CL
YD

ECR
.

RD.

A.
COVENTRY

CR
.

DR
.

A L
ISH

NA

LN
.

ET
ON

ST
.

TR
AIL

S
TIM

BE
R 

CT.(PVT.)HARBOR

CT
.(P

VT
.)

CO
VE

BA
Y

AV.

NEEDLES

RIDGE
RIVA

VENETIANCIT
A

STAR

CT.
LIEGE
IRON
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R

RIATA

RECES

LARKSPUR
BLUE

DR
.

ER
O

NO
CA

N

CR.

TIM

V.A

KING

DR.

LE
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BE
R

CT.
EDGIRCT.

CT.
ROSSMERE

ERPPEPLUC

DR
.

HU
NT

LE
IG

H

CT.
DARTFORD

CT.
WYDOWNCT.

ALTON

CT
.

SN
OW

DO
N

CT.ANDREWS

DR
.

NO
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WA
Y
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RR

IA
GE

HRTLWONEK

CT.
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.
ST
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DR.

NOTNAT S

OL
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EN
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.
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RW
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D

CT.BYRONCT
.

PIN
E

CT.
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CT.MERRITT

DR.
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CT.
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.ST
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H
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CT.DEEPWOOD BL
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.
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PE
R

AV.ARKE

OAKSHOBSON
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.
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ONLN

.
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.
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WP
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H
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.

SH
AG

BA
RK

CT
.

HE
DG

CT.

BAILEY

ORCHARD

CT.

BE
LL

OX
FO

RD

CT.
SURREY

AV.
SURREYRI

VE
R

AV.PI
CT.PIER
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.

VIE
W

LA
KE

DR.AW
KIO

AV.SNAELRO

CT
.

CH
AL

ME
TT

E
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AC
H

CR.
RIDGE
RIVER

OA
K

GR
EA

T

CT.CHATHAM

RD.

CT.PHAETON CT.
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RD.
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EGAIRRA C
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.

EX
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OR

CT.
LEEDS

CT.WINSLOW

DR.

WARWICK
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.

SW
AL

LO
W
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L

KIL
LD

EE
R

LN.
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.
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.

LIA
E
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M
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HULLST.

87TH
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.
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K 

ST
.

E.

O H
SO
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CT.
LL 

LN.

LN.

CT.

DR
.

KIL
LD
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LN.
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.
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B.
A.

ST.

KAUAI
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.
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.
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.
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E
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Y
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.
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LL
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E BR
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KE
NR

IDG
E

SIR

(GRID 150)

(GRID 150)

 8. FORDHAM CT.(164)

IDG

DENISON

PICE  CR.

C.

15. VALLEY VIEW CT.(179)
14. VALLEY RIDGE CT.(179)
13. HIDDEN VALLEY DR.(179)
12. VANDERBILT CT.(179)
10. BELOIT CT.(165)
 9. CARNEGIE CT.(164)

 6. TUFTS CT.(164)
 5. BUTLER CT.(164)
 4. DRAKE CT.(164)
 3. RUTGERS CT.(164)
 2. DARTMOUTH CT.(164)
 1. DUQUESNE AV.(164)

L. HOLLOW BEND CT.
K. STEEPLEBROOK CT.
J. SHADY GROVE CT.
I. THISTLE HILL CT.
H. PLEASANT RUN CT.
G. LAZY HOLLOW CT.

F. LITTLE BERRY CT. 
E. CHASE POINTE CT.
D. BENT CREEK CT.
C. HOLLYTOWNE CT.
B. FLOWERFIELD CT.
A. STRAWBRIDGE CT.

CRANSHIRE

11. SLIPPERY ROCK CT.(165)
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.
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SE
A

 7. IONA CT.(164)
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RE
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T.
TA

LL
 O

AK
S

DR.

DOOWMIST

CT.STALLIONBLACK 

DR.
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.
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16. GEORGETOWN CT.(165)
17. BRANDEIS CT.(165)
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WEEK 4A = 28.9 MI
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